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Report The Cell for Community Extension and Outreach, St. Xavier’s 
College, Village Panchayat, Ucassaim and the NSS Unit, St. Xavier’s 
College collaborated for a visit to ‘Mama Margaret Home For Boys’ 
at Ucassaim on 24th September 2024 from 3.00 p.m. onwards.  

In preparation for the visit, the NSS unit facilitated a donation drive 
for 3 days of required non-perishable food items and daily use items. 
The probable items listed to be donated were staples like sugar, oil, 
different types of dals, milk powder, rawa, coconut, toothpaste, 
bathing soap, washing soap bar, rice, etc. The in-charge for the 
Donation drive was Dr. Seema D. Fernandes (NSS PO) and NSS 
PRO Mr. Ruzario Sequeira (TYBA) and Ms. Ninoshka Fernandes 
(SYBCOM) in association with Ms. Vilma Fernandes (Member, Cell 
for Community Extension and Outreach, St. Xavier’s College). The 
NSS volunteers, teaching and non-teaching faculty donated the 
required items in large numbers. The items were neatly packed in a 
box by NSS volunteers and taken to the Home.  

The Programme at ‘Mama Margaret Home For Boys’ started at 3.00 
pm. Dr. Rheane da Silva (NSS CPO) briefly introduced Fr. Juze, 
Director of the Home, present for the programme. The items brought 
were handed over to the Home. Fr. Juze briefed the gathering of 
teachers and NSS volunteers on the life, stay and education of the 
boys of the Home. This was followed by a game organised by NSS 
volunteers and NSS CPO Dr. Rheane da Silva, which was very 
entertaining. Mr. Omkar, a resident of the home sang a song for the 
NSS unit and visitors. At the end of the programme a dance was 
performed by NSS Volunteers Mr. Jaden, Mr. Aryan and Mr. Derrick. 
Snacks and Juices were distributed to the boys. Mr. George D’Souza 
(Ex-member, VP Ucassaim Panchayat), was also present for the get-
together, along with Ms. Vilma Fernandes, Faculty, St. Xavier’s 
College and Dr. Rheane da Silva and Dr. Seema Fernandes.
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